TR €. St.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Y. 3. -E1.Te.-3.-09042022-235021
CG-DL-E-09042022-235021

AT
EXTRAORDINARY

AT [I—EvE 3—39-g78 (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TFRHTE & FHTforaT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

g, 275 7% faeeft, AT, A9« 8, 2022/47 18, 1944
No. 275] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, APRIL 8, 2022/CHAITRA 18, 1944

AR AT Foerg

PR
T2 faeet, 8 arder, 2022

qT.H1.1. 289(e7).—arATT Aferf=w, 1934 (1934 w7 22) Fit amer 14 F el Famater amga=
T, 1937 7 2T Fomas F * foru wtaaa Fgwt #5719y aEe ST @Emes § 9T aoe it
gferg=AT Fear ananfA. 679 (o) arE 30 fAdew 2021 T S Ged F TSI q€TETO T 1,
T 3, 3T-g< (i) & yriora fram @ o, S zo8 gartaa g arer sartaa asdft safeat 1 aw s
Fferg=T 7 gafate Trore £ afqat sear F o suersy Fow s A a7 i fam i amfa a o,
ATt T g et e

AT, ST ATGAAT § Aafaree Tt A fat S=ar w7 1 FFay, 2021 FT 3T FE T8 AT,

v, fAfafee gafa & diaw w7 Faat F @eg § S=ar § wreq a7 g 1w e
P T 2

zaform, o FT FewE A Afaaw 1934 (1934 F7 22) it a7 4, 5 #HiT 10F F qefiT
ST oTfRAT AT AN FT g0, AAT A, 1937 F A Geree Fe F forw fAeferfaa Faw aw et g,
-
1. TfEreq AT A ITEd- (1) =7 (9=t F1 SiEreg 9 arE (9w gere) [{E, 2022 7

(2 7 F9F® TS § T T AT A A T9T 2

2549 GI/2022 ()



2

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

2. amgE™ FEw, 1937 4, -
(®) w34, -

(i) @= (11) 7T @< (107) F =T F T HATHd 53T 0T, d7 T [ deqithg g (109) F
oA T7, FeterfeT sway @ i G s, gt

“(11) AT ITHT IE AAAT” F TAT A ATAAT & A ITLR TR F LA g, A A
ITHTOT 3T A=t & Ser § Fft B ¥ weree S e # 39a war g

(i) =T (21F) T @< (217FF) F =T § [THCANHT HAT ST, @7 T O Teqithg g
(217%) F @ 17, Feferfea g aazntia G s, aut-

(iii)

(iv)

“(217F) ‘ST IUF F IS TATAA! K (FAA AT e § [ g F o weer
FTOT AT =tr AR g, S SS % A¥iad 991 & (o0 4 Traee (Taae-34-
FHIE) T AT 2a7 &, HF F2ar § i TgrEar 31 e

gz (217) F Te=Ta, Fefota g o =i G s, aur-

“(2177) "SETT ST AfeAT" T UF UAT SUH AT g ST UF FATAAET IS I F
AT TETT FAT 8, AT ST STHLT TA0aTa, A0, B, soeitas arfte % av
= vt T yorrferEt < v R aoft F B F foare < sem Rt
AT AT AT E;

(21%.) "SE A=TF" T UHT ITHLOT g ST UF (597 BFoe 99 F 32 F 71 9%
gttt w2 Fear g, &= Hfr a5 7itm, GrE, T o, fEe g
fAe=ror T, ST AT T F qEEAT F ATAA AATEL0T A T2 i 39 I w
BTt T ST FOTArEr B AT ST AT AT ST g

(219) "ST ATETEH TAAT ITF" F IS ATETF, ST TOHAT TAAF AT qA
ITHLOT IS e At g e s v sz A7 Rl v e fr s 2157

@< (337) F = o fAeferfa g war s, seiq-

“(33%) "FqTA" T S A, T, IO AT Ha5 TR 9% FET F oI afteT g,
ST T e, 35, S AT d9g 9 A AT se Jrgar gRfEe w4 F o
araeT g, S dravgrer, e, wfaerm s, 3 qere, e Gl srere a1 aoma &
afersate off aftafoa &7

(v) @< (48F7) 307 48(@) F = 7%, ReafertaT @<t #1 v ST, aeiq—

“(48%F) “Tear ¥ 9g Rty afese & s Fam F = T gafea, auE =96 g0
qEAT | e it § gag Taw F7 g 914 @AY uF T w17 9% FEt
REIREL

TIEF — T @ AN, T8 T T 6T A 9g FAaH a7 g St
AT =ATE § et qurTet T Areated 2

(48@) "qEaT TTer F S Fwme wdfa sat v R T g2t w1 s gt
He AT AT Gl 1 He AfHUq 2, St ST S2ar F i v a7 I@E 94w
=T for B StTaT 2;

(48%) "HaT I F G A w Hed #§ Hentey, sata v fGEwer G o qeer
=TT AT ST g I =5 [ReAT Yao 329FT % oIy SR a=maT S 99,

(48%) "mrar e 7 Gl o g 7 gt w4 F T Gentre G = e
Rt 7 aqaes T 1




[ATT I—ATE 3(i)] ST T TSI © FETATIOT 3

=) faw 29(7) 7 299 F =7 § TH-H=F T T SO A7 =9 TH1T 8961 597 297 %
wo=Tq, et e daenta s, auafq—
“29z. gfferd dwar Raf&T yureft-Are Fame aereaTes awafET 3T gartE @ear
GITHAT T AT 12T AT 52T AT S T 01 e & o v afqard gwar foafdr
JUITEAT LTI 9T e o forw gt fafafEe sam
29+, wfegs dwar RafEr yurft.— (1) 97 fmme sgieaes awafEs a1 gafEg
AT GIHAT T¢ ST ST AT FLAT ToAT UEIa Fed o giaer F oy us w3t g
FoaifEsr et earfia wam, S Faw 29=. F aefia et afvEmd geer fqitér goref
FTET THET Tl ST FF4T 2
(2) s7-fFw (1) F eim znfog ST dvar fonfér st e grfr div =as
Teeqr Rt yorett <div TEfe St F 9T ST STer T 59T SMERT J S w5
FGM T FlT TR T THE THAT 0, 97 52T ST A% §27 g7 et o=
ST ¥ WreA & T AT S FHAT B
(3) Sw-fA=w (1) F «refi= UF v B0 10 wer STer ST geaT TEh Y T THE qqqE
1 strosfy fSrea |qer F gfatera a7 TSt 0 26 ST F 2T ST w9, i StEa
=] F g @ ST 7 (e S arer e 7 @A F a7 # A= adr a9 Wi
SR,
() = 30 ¥, Sa-fFFw (17) & we=ma, Fefertea Feae e G s, auiq—
‘(1) Fra T, et oe® F ara-ar aeeT T g UE, UF a9 A gaty, 59 s
T H TF a9 e Freaw G S awar 2, F oo uw oS e anfaa w7 i 81
(=) Faw 359,
(i) 3T-FF=w (3%) F 7wt fAtortad s9-fFaw et e s, aatq—
“(3@) U Tl e afera 99 F O a9 g9 ®90 7 9oF 27 SR A UE Aree
T TF I H TH ST FT F G T AW TEE=T ST THT 2
(i) 37-F=w (4) F = u, fetefaa sa-fag i war s, geta-
“(4) 97 FT ST AeTHaerT g FfAtEs G 7 womeits =7 fr smomy;
() e 38 @ % wo=ma, FeaferfaT Faw daetu fogar s, aeiq—
“387. SST ITF FgAET. — (1) 12 i T=TorF HEIHLF & [ATGAIET F f&GAr By
=< FT IS ITF % =T F HTF 71 AT
(2) S=T IUF FT ATHIET ITH F7 & (o707 UF T=Th [Feiiig 9o F A Agr=aaers 57
AT FE THAT 2
(3) wETIH=erT ST I F AqArad  forg ervared 1 Afafde #7767 21
(4) wETR=eT, =7 THT TETE g 97 5 Gl =~ T 55 9w F = # w19 7 F He
Tl areATedt 1 T T T 8, THTET FT IS AUF T ATHET TET L THAT 2

(5) 3-FF=w (4) F @i o= 7= aqere, = 9% =4 fefET a1 o= 72 G srar g, o=
Y & Atee T Fate & forw Jgr 737, T FHTE g9 U, WA 36 UF a1 H I a9
arfer i erafar ¥ forg Ffietpa #7790 21
(B) ST YT F =T F AAAET F (o7 7 T g U AT ISTTT TTF AT F TAH0T
F forw g wrr 21 g i |1 ET g



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]
(7) 917 FT ST Hertaer® g e A & e = & fEr s

(=) fr=w 397 &, su-f=w (1), Aot # -
(i) 9 5. (ii) T S&a gataq gt % = g, At w9 g & gtateat w i w@r

NEuLRER EREIk feav) @ )
(i _:El;_:vfcr uw;%]-imd(%qﬁm%—vﬁ?ﬂ‘a) gy |

EIEEIEG
(i) | S=T ¥feaT TR AtTees 7 aqata g R | T ThwE
¥ Jerar T

(ii) %9 . (iii) 7, =9 (3) §, “T0=T U 9TeaT F TATA UL “TH TGT " OU5aT HT T@T STUAT
(=) = 417 &, 3v-fw (3) F wo=m, Feforta sa-few e G s, i
"(3%) HETHE9TT JF Tt AT TEETT & ATAET F (o7 qaerai #1 & E w7 a7 g

(3%) Su-f9=w (3) F @i fZar 7= aqHEy, 5= 9% [Fefag ar = 72 A ST g, e AT q
arfers fit arafer & form Ser w29, <7 FH g U, HETHe T 36 US a9 § UHT g9ter F fory anr
AR T THA © AT T AT F ATIF Tl g

(3%) wETfeerF, SU-fAaw (3) F T AquIeT I TAAST A T & AHIH0 = + o
whert f gl ff #7 awa & o sa Gf o Bty w7 a5g € Sad = wwe f s A

ST
(=) 41T -
i, ofiti=h &, "aqHTER" 9T5% F T X "STH" 957 T@T SITUA,
i, sT-fEw (4) §, @ (M) &,
() "ET A T =Y Tl F T O, T TG F A A" 91 TET AT,
(@) T A AT AT ST
(iii) S-F=m (5) F e we fasforfere v sroa, srat-
"(5) ST T ST FElH9TF T (A HEE &7 F ol aredq 7 a4 S
(=) = 417 % wo=Ta, F=fertaT Fee Fr o s, ai-
"4437. SETT ATETIT TTAT TTHTIT FFAAT THTITT -
(1) T, ST AT TINAT STHFCT F FFAAT THOTTA G AT HEATHRT 02 F A0 BFam=
TR BT ST ATET0T T(AT TR & Tl | ST FFAAT THIT F TeATIT F (o7 AT
T T 9o F a7 A= % a7 2
ST - T IT-(4TH F TS 2, T F AT 2
(F) TF AT
(@) = et & aefie aqetea sforer @vrs; ar
(1) I ATETOT T STHIU % HATAT AT TELETT F [o70 FEarhrT 52 F AR @S yrfessor
BT ATHITEA TR0 HT5|




[ATT I—ATE 3(i)] ST T TSI © FETATIOT 5

(2) wETH=eTF, FFAAT THTITA AT ISTT AT TTNAT TTHU F FTATIT 0 ATATAT AT T STHL0N
w7 gforeAr % T A7 A EE F: A 2

(3) WIS, T 19 F FHTET g 9% 5 7g Tf7 Fraavelt 7 @7 FeAT €, FATRAN, Faar THorT
ST T THAT & AT A ST [T T IS ATETT TTTAT STHLI F FAAT THITT T T T THdT
2

(4) wrE ff TATETET Y=, a9 wEET F GO F O U AR a1 9T IS AET0T T
ITFCOT FT START 395 3T AAEE =7 49w GfF F ggihzes g e aq@ iy s fro fGe=r =2
T

(6) 72 werfAzes F1 =9 a1 1w At 2 5 TE = F foru w@tw argw g, 9 3% gAans v
FFET T A FOT F e & F @ Fed F 79T, FATRATT, T THI7 T A7 qr=ra7 F7 [Aeifaa a7
TE F qHAT 2

(6) ST-F= (3) el =T T AT AT Ymorsr a1 /e, S 9% efa ar = 98 G Srar
g, T TF 2T a9 F ATgT A G4t F oy o 29, A7 THE S 9, AHae® T AN A g9ty F
oo T F7 a9 & ST UF a1 § &7 a9 gt i aate F oo agi gem

(7) 5700 fretoma & afars & wfersan aq8a T5-aF 9% 919 BFAe T % o Feear sarores a1
IS ATETOT JAEAT STHI 5 TATIT 5 (o0 9[7F Fael 27 TG FTU GRIT AT AT T AT 7
TEATTT % THHL F oI e U Ay F70 gF R T,

(8) 5700 eI % AfaFa® AqHT TH-AMF T AT AN THE F &0 TRaar T9707 97 a7 39
ALETEH TIAA ITHLT F qATIH F o0 90 Faear UF A" T AT AT FATCRANT TH THIT T AT
eI % T % o, F 7= g5 ' i

(9) =T 7T THTE ST w99 7 Afieeh 7fer a1 i =2 7m=m #7 @mra, S off arfers 2, 37 gt afE sem
AIETTF TCAA F AFAAT T T F TATIT F FART AT TR0 & Fag § [, ST a1
e, e % arge el of za o fir st 2

10) 905 FT ST FEl=arF 5T Afafes O T o=zt =1 F G s

=) fRaa 48 &, -

(i) 37-fF=| (1) ¥, F8 "o (ix) 797 399 gataq gfateat F e w et 77 9w ¢ gbfear
“(ix)  [STRT TETeAT AfTeAT= AT STuAT 2500 9T 9T T

(X) [STET T A’ 9 AT o SToEt ;. 5000 F0 g 9

(
(

(if) 37-F= (2) #, arifom awr % T v, Fefertad v S fEr S, aEt-

FaTfRafa, "ot S wrE F o, aerefT ar gfvver, - BEE A7 S aq= T S F 47 T
Tay H TAT SOl AT TEA FLA AT ATFFAT N, AT AT TH TR TOAF FT IS TLHAT IT
AT % 0 AT & & ST ST 8, 97 (oo 7% Feald TEFE B <7 g, A0 -

(iii) 37-f=w (2%) F T w% FterfaT sw-fEet F1 7@ ST, aetq-
"(2F) = TS AT TEHATT F AT a1 T4rw0r + forw, el g 37 g, wufq -
(i) = TSl AT T AT AgHE: 10,000/- F0
(ii) = TS AT TEEART T A=A 1HT: 5,000/ FAT
(27FF) TAT [ FT SFIATT AT ZTT AT =T F TAFIF q1ead o 521 Srusm”;




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART IISEC. 3(i)]
@) o 61 %, -
i. S fREET (3), (4) 9T (45%) F =1 97 5% SU=E F7 @ S, qetd—

“(3) famm wEeaTe Attt aqsty o Gt afoet, s-afvay, sar off @ 8 55
ATATE T2 63T ST, 9T —

() 2ot =, 1 e sT-Sfoat # aftpa BT T &
i) T 1 TZLoA~ 2d13;
i)y U2 uEE e,
iy T 3 FerHied At
iv) T4 germited fre)
(@) =1 F1 et s-afvrat § asftga BT @ &-
() @ 1.1 T I,
(i) = 1.2 Tz e,
(iiy =@ 1.3 FATHIEA A=,
(iv) = 1.4 A= foe
@M T ' 2, FEft FrEET T @ 2
(=) =t FTITT 9T AR T G2UA Tl AT LT Z1T AT 22 'Forees T, ST 7 S
(F) 739 @ 3, 2000 e & afewaw T-ais 71 die 399 F9 F fieea-3s a-9aasss
IERIEIRE R D
(=) w5t 3 F1 Faferfad STt & afiga Gy @ e
() 1 FEfSe Aerae
i) 31 e

i)y z2Y: FEISE 9T Ao i FEAISE A2 AR 1;

(

(

(iv) 32: TS HATA T ATZE TATATFE 1 T,
(V) Z3U: BT T,

(vi) 33T i e,

(vii) ZAT: glE-TAT WAL,

(viii) Z4STT: FT=e TaewmTe 2 f TEeior; 99w

(ix) 35: = TAThTTe 2 F ffam o= 9 uaeforem
feoqur: wree TErTETE 1 qUT ATTE TATATEE 2 F AR wETEeE g AATMA NS U AT AT
TR
(@) wat, 1 o e et uw A
(4) TF AT TELETT AT T2 & T, T4 90 F 3TA9 (12) F afersmta samor Ferrteasmd

T AT FTT o (o117 SEehT AT, TET LI F THIAT ZHT AR

() =1, @2, @23, T 47 3 ¥av & fou "&faq amgaw ar e e, wgibeas swr
FarfaAfEe g




[ATT I—ATE 3(i)] ST T TSI © FETATIOT 7

(i) =t @3 F forw, gEie ¥ 2000 Fretnrm aferray -t 9T a9 THE w9 -
(iif) =t 7 orw g YT wwiET agt gntn;
37 37w (5), @< (1) &, ST@=t (i) 797 (i) F = 9% 7 Sude w@r ST, aei-
(i) T= T o, ST-T=11 @1.2, T1.4 97 T34 @3 F foru:
() FTATT T | S 9 F7 ATARTT AT TaE@Td AT, AT

(=) safad e T #1 qarea F9 gu, Wwﬁﬁaﬁwmw
IIIT TAT A E@EE § B ar #= A g oar R wvear g ReafEeEme |
Shfrafar & Ry s g ar

() "Efa e T 7 qu1ET Fd gU, FEE TATET § U q9 F7 ATARIF TETErT
g T FEw 133@ F g aqeied wforAn Sed g ST araesy HEe
TETETE T TEATLET T ¥ o 2

(i) ST-=RT @11 FAT @ 1.3 TAT T=+ @2 F for:
() FTATT TATEAT | T T FT ATIGNEF (AHTT TELETT AT T

(=) Hatea freew T #1 wwifea #7d gu, WW%@?W’TWWW
IAIT TAT A @EE § B ar #= A g oar R avear g RreafEeEme |
Shfafar & Ry s g ar

() =efeT e ST F1 7R T2 gu, AW =TT § A T00 B AR TEIETT
g9 77 FEw 1337 F FfiT aqEIET TivAw e FET SA e AT A
TETETS TN THATLET T FF o 2

(i) Wt @23 F T I

() FETT forees T #7 AR Fd g0, ATGATT TATET § T qUL HT ATAGNE T
A, F(E AT F TH T3 T FIE GETT TFATRT TN T} & 7 27
(=) gETT fRreew T FT 99T T gv, Wwﬁﬁ?ﬁwmw

ITT TAT AGAW @EE 7 = g w7 A g oAr G wrear ym Geatremey &
Stifafar & fe5ft wrea = = g ar

(1) TERTT Foreew Y& i1 FA1ET T2 g0, F1A AT # UF a9 FT AENE TEiErd
9T FAT FFw 1337 F i aaEIed TiqAw e g SAIerT areg T AT
TETETE T TRAATIAT 2T FF (o147 2l

(i @) w3t 3 % forg

() T ST-aT § TECETT FEATRAT & TIATTTer TITLTT FT FHIRT FeA ATl AT F
TATAT | &7 aU1 T AT ATAT; T

(=) T Toreew YT FT @wifEd T gu mwﬁwaﬁwmw
ATT TAT AN @ 7 = ar w7 A g oar G wrerar ym Geatemes |
ﬁﬁﬁw&wﬁ%ﬁmﬁvﬁé‘rmﬁﬂww3@%a%mwwﬁwwm
TATTTT AT AT TaCaTs T TR I F< [T 2

T fET TRt AT ST-aT AT BT T= AT ST-UE & dqeia A7 G aqety gq e
Raea ﬁ e F o, w=, ST-aent A7 9F few W § g ARG w@eEd aq9d,
AT 51T FATa s grm:




8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

g Ag o % AN arEETT TEeETE aEew § g % 9 § 6 U a9 6 Wh A999 F
T AT AT TEEETT AT ATgT qEIT T § AT g U1 ATIGF T
TEIET AT FT STETATT () T (i) § afesntEa aiemet F qw /7 S
i, IEE (1) #, @ (F) #, a=@ Ot a8, 2wl o T I g 6 S W e T A
ST |
(iv) Iaf (12) §, —

(F) T (i) &, TS0 (@) H, 95aT “TAT @3 95F, AT AT AF h T IT YA @3 AT T4 3
ST

(@) == (iii) F TamE, FafrfeT g dqwntig G s, aua—

“(iiiF) TRT @23 AT T2 FT JaT Fd g T ST H3 97 Bt yonfeat o waw@me
T e F o0 @23 qgras FHAET F 91 9 56 59§ o, e =1 F gqaty w awtia
Foreew e it i F e Setaeht ot o2 o AT T, Fur vassy S i g
FA THT, STt qAA AT FHR(Awa qoredt F fqe getrae @i JaEdy wrEt wr g, s
FATAT ATAT T (o1 Haer T TV T ArT9THaT 2t 21"
(1) @< (iv) F TeaTa, et @ #r da:wta G s, auia—

“(ivaF) Fat B AT g T AT K (AARE T o S w7 7 AT g, st @269 @i
i3 i e sonfert 7% 0 T TETErE F w0 0 s 9grEE FHAET T w0 T 5 F (o,

23T, AR e rEHeT (uad) e TrEdiey ey 9T w #; 9w o= Juraeht
TUITTeTAT 9% SATEHAT AT FOT o (o1T J¥er TEEA0 il ArF9FTaT gl 21"

(v) suf=e (14) % = o, fMefefa saffay & s agiqa—

“(14) TaW IT&T § At argaT TEeare SSEE G oo F, A % 97 v 644w 9w
3T o £ ot 7, == Faw F aefiw 5o Aol § uw argae e ISaE aqety e A
ST &AL &, ST UHT orat % areqefi g S wgriaer® gy FAnteitatEe i s

() AR 62, -
(i) Tt (1) &, 7ol &, 92 (2.) F o=, 79 d=ai (i) 797 379 gatuq gf3fte F o 17,

o

fRrerferfera s |ear i F9 degis & STTu, aeqta—

(i) |(F) BTET T F T 97 500 =. Jfa =171
(@) ATTATET TEEAT F T 97 1500 =. 93 o=
(1) | 9 ATTATET TLET % 79 97 (ASAEE) 3,000 =. wfq gora=

(ii) ST (2) F = = et i T s, auia—
“(2) HAT [ FT AT AT g7 FATEFara s {f § sorras e § B smoem”
() = 84 &, <1 a1 orez, STT-Fal T 3 T &, F T ¢ "I+ I 9157 TET SITUAT,
(=) fiaw 87 &, sufa=w (3), & =+ uw Rwtertae e vt stro, srerta—

“(3) HAT 7 T AT HEIHLF FIT FATAA SR ZAFTF ST Aread 7 Far srom”™
O = 1339 &, —

(i) 3T (1) §,—




[ATT I—ATE 3(i)] ST T TSI © FETATIOT 9

(F) @< (F) F, 7@ (i) &, "F47 = argEe fF q97 g FEar T9gq" o0t F T 1w

"7 Tt afga” geT T S,

@) g< (@) ¥,

i) "HAT AT ARFAT T T 5T F T U WA IgAT ARTAT TIAT" 957 T ST,
(i) "srfereror A" orsEt F T 9w "wiorror AW T ageerr aforv we yedHl" e
ST,
(i) STt=w (3%) F Tara, el wqs a=a:ertT B s, aata—

"o T e A gars aivagd 9 ¥ e g e gars aivagT g9 § o9 fae

F TEEE F o 39aw (3) F i ya T @ gy, 59 96 5 SefEa a1 = T G
AT BT, WEIHS9TH ZTT TATE ST ATATAT FT T F2 TC AT F AT =8 a0 Hif qaid %
oo fafemrr = Tar 5qz g U7, werHeeE 79 aut i afatew @@ty F o agaeT v
AR 7 7 21

(@) = 13374, —
(i) sufaam (1) &, "Frt off fAfreror, ofer =1 adeor aanfea s % ot ae2t #1 s
STTUAT,

(i) Satv=w (2%) ¥, "safaw (1) § sfeafea e, w8ar a1 T o=t F w1 7, "aqae
T AT AT ATHIET F faeare F forg Ffreror, sram wer a1 e ores w3 ST,

(
(

(iii) S (2@) #, -

() "R orez F T 9T, A MO 95T TET ST,

(@) "ITHIE" 9757 % T T, "AIHIET AT T F( AT TAAHL00" 97s T S0,

(iv) IR (4) |, "G TSR K T T FAFLIT ET F AT AT T 9157 T S0,

(1) = 134(F) ®, safaw (5) F, -
(i) T (3T) F T, "AT" 9% A ETiaa AT S
(ii) =T U =e (31) F v, et g i aeasmenta G s, gt —
() - T T 9T T AT ST Fea g qYHTE 5T aT9E of {ordT T4 § 4r
g F AT =T e
(3) 7w 154 §,—
(iy @< (F) &, "FEE0r ST AT 9TeET T O "AEAT T e, yAfner 9u1 3gaT
AT YY" 9757 T SATUAT,
(ii) @ (F) ¥, " =TTl TEeErT gorrett e 71 qiser qurest SEer e e e g
9TEET o T T, "THAT® T99 Sga NFdT Tae= TAT AT SrEar Fa” gew o ST,
() = 155% &, —
(i) sfe=w (2) F g, et saftes gea=ntug o sroar, agfa—

“(2%) TR (2) F @i wa AT @ aquen, s 95 F fetEg o = T G T,
w134 F adfim S B U gaE afETers =T 9 ST aEe gare aEgd 99t §
FEATT ATH T AR | ATaF T AT a9 qu0 0F qatd % o e @ 727 992 89 7,
RIS T qUT T AT date F o7 TqATe 7 T 600 F7 T g1

(2@) saf=w (2) F @efi= v Gt = aq@e, S99 6 fefea v = 7 G g, R 134
F eI ST 360 1w garE afesTers wHrT e aqg it aei gars afvagT dar § w41 Hay




10

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

134% % Fefi ST B0 10 Az-erqa e w= e wiHe-aeF St F ae # afeew § wfeew 9t aut
£ gafe F o GAfmm = 99 992 29 1w, seiHas ot a9t A7 afatew amta F o
TS T THHH T T 2

(2 safFEw (2) F @i wa= T =T aqHEy, S 9% F fFeteg a1 = T G @ g, G
1347 % aefi ST B0 OrfersTe-ames =t~ & areer § Afeen & atee &1 aut B gty % o
ffermT=a T2 T HqE W T, HETHS9E AT AU AT ATIE At F O aqEET T T
T TR 21"

(i) Suff=m (3) #, @ (@) #, "ATe AT Frawr o=t F v 7 e faE agrieearera”
9Teg T STTUAT;

() =\ 155% & wo=rm, fetertea Faw aea:enfua G so, ot -

"155%, g - (1) a7 155 F e aqarad T2 Fed F foru Fefeted qew 3 grm, [t
Tt & foe Fft af=mes & geag #:

(i) w134 F wefiq S frar @ aqafya gard aftags @& F af=rew % oo g
wRETerE ST 47 A 134 F @i aagET gar T "6 % = & o S G
AT EATE THATAF THTTTA-E T2 ZAT<F ST (] argaT 7 99q Iga+ FRaar Jaad 7 afeferd
gl 8 @ =T

(i) F=wr 134 & wrefia ot Bram s aqEa gard aftagT = F afees % oo gar
wfe=Ters THTOTT AT AW 134 F FefiT aqT ant gars atEes 39T F ai=res & oo s
T =T garE afiETerE - A ST T A T a9 SgAT Angar yaeT J
gfenfera g 4 @ra =7

(iii) = 1347 F aefiv ST FraT @ f7-aqgT af=mes =i ar Faw 1347 F a6 -
AT T T -1 e ST T A A g9d SgaT AT YAy § G g
2 AT F9T

(iv) Far 1347 ¥ wefiq sy Bt mar wfesre =1 ffaw 1349 % s afeme-ar ==t s
Tft T i T SgaT ANAar S § Ffeaterd g 2 @+

(2) = 155% F eI A= F T@L F AH A5 1 FFEa #5793 (1) F 9T 37
[ T A gl R m

(3) 9 WeTiear g AT AtEs AfF & =ormeitas Areaw T I 6a1 ST

() AT H, -

(i) =TT ofteie 3 arefi= 47 8% * Ui, fwrtertard e SISt ST, &y ; -

"9, TR - fFF7 42 v S 1| F qEArT arer F A aterefaa £ 78 auar F#r aeww
BT ST T T HATTST THTOT I &1 TF A A TIET FT TeHeor f3ar ST wear
gl

(ii) & = ofrd= F aefie, -

() T2 (1) §, STl "aq=ia ST F27 % T I G0 F a4, -

() &< (%) &, IUEe (iv) §, "SI TH9 9 720" T8l % T 9T, "5 2qH qTAF L1 9757 T S,
(i) == (31) F Teme, et womgs aea: =t T S, a9t -

"o 5, wETiaeer, Eefimiey % ffE g T 97 aqEited wee aId 17 e
TEET AT I THAT T <97 F FATEA A AANT < 79 21"

@) ¥ (6) H, Imefie= "FAerarfa" ¥ e, weer waw H, e A {1 F agew 1i= -
A AT TF FFATTT T2 TAT TF AW FOAAT =T F A T SH-AF AT T FTq00T
" orex T ST,




[T (=72 3(i)]

(iii) & @ ofrd= ¥, -
(®) &7 (1) &, STl "aq= i ST F24 F T 97 G0ar” F g6, w9 (2) F 49 F A9 b,
Fraferfee Togs ava=ntua BT s, auta-

T %, wErtmer, et ¥ Rt s e o aqeifi v S W e
TEET AT I THAT T <90 F FATA A AANT < 79 21"

(@) T (3) &, Iwefid "R F aefiw, =@ (7) H, "FGAN" a5 F T U, "GqAH AT
AT 5T A AT FTse AT 53 T ST,

(m) 2T (6) 3, Twefie “FraRrm 3 ofi, -
(i) TE TEGF H, "N T 9T5ET T T, "I, T AT W qrere” o7 T S,
(ii) TEST T % AT, e T g T S, e -

"ig % UF T F | 5700 AR F GfeF aS arer A wiedl % Taee-ga-FHIE F =
# %0 T F9 100 5 FT I3 4999 2 1 237 #, == 3% it a9ferg gear 71 gg 9% 707 fFar s
aFar g, oH T F9 T 79 J19 79 9% e

(iv) gmeT (@), -

®) 7 (2) ®, swefid= "Ffemrmar F adim, @ (@) &, "Swheor T S5 adiemt oeat &
T T, "STHLIT LA A H0T STT=" 9752 T ST

(@) T (3) ¥, Swefider "o  Fefie, @ (F) F = ww, Mwtefad d@< #r @ s,
AT~

"(F) T WIEF F AT AT AL 5T FAq AqAied e aqEd I g ey W
AT LT THATFT S FT HATISTAT &3 F 2T F7 F 12|

(v) amer g ofid= F arefi, &= 3 1 < BT S
(F) AT VI &, 7 2 fF, Freeit 2 F, -
(i) % et 39 F T, FeferfeT 70 deais diw = f® amqetug 7 STt oot -

FTEA T TSI AATATIOT 11

“39%.

o 387 F sufaaw

7w 38w #T

(1) =T ITerad

sfaas (1)

|7 3”

(ii) 9 "eATF 41 % Tera, et 77 e @7 af@at® awenfia £ s, gt -

417,

e 417 F safaaw

e 41w

(4) FT IoT=

Safaaw (4)

|7 5”

[, &. TA1-11012/1/2021-15f1]

q=s FATE (7o, =g atee

foroqur- et e e 3 st it e 41-26 arde 23 |7, 1937 Yo R v F s
faw o "L, 327 (@) 9" 13 92, 2021 ST Hfad Feh GO % TSI, AATHTI,
g |, @2 3, Suee (i) § ardeE 1 92, 2021 & ghrio fro o



12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 8th April, 2022

G.S.R. 289(E).—Whereas, the draft of certain rules further to amend the Aircraft Rules, 1937, was
published as required under section 14 of the Aircraft Act, 1934 (22 of 1934), vide notification of the
Government of India in the Ministry of Civil Aviation, number G.S.R. 679 (E), dated the 30" September,
2021 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), inviting objections and
suggestions from all persons likely to be affected thereby, before the expiry of the period of thirty days
from the date on which copies of the Gazette containing the said notification were made available to public;

And whereas, copies of the Gazette containing the said notification were made available to the
public on the 1* October, 2021;

And whereas, the objections and suggestions received from the public in respect of the draft rules
within the period specified have been taken into consideration;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 4, 5 and 10A of the Aircraft Act,
1934 (22 of 1934), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Aircraft
Rules, 1937, namely: —
1. Short title and commencement. — (1) These rules may be called the Aircraft (First Amendment)

Rules, 2022.

2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Aircraft Rules, 1937, —
(A) inrule 3, —
(1) clause (11) shall be re-numbered as clause (10D) and after clause (10D) as so re-numbered,
the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—
“(11) “Basic Instrument Flight Trainer” means a device which is equipped with

appropriate instruments, and which simulates the flight deck environment of an aircraft in
flight in instrument flight conditions;”;

(ii) clause (21A) shall be re-numbered as clause (21AA) and before clause (21AA) as so re-
numbered, the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(21A) “Flight Dispatcher” means a person designated by the operator to engage in the
control and supervision of flight operations, who supports, briefs and assists the pilot-in-
command in the safe conduct of the flight;”;

(ii) after clause (21C), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(21D) “Flight Procedures Trainers” means a device which provides a realistic flight deck
environment, and which simulates instrument responses, simple control functions of
mechanical, electrical, electronic and the like, aircraft systems, and the performance and
flight characteristics of aircraft of a particular class;
(21E) “Flight Simulator” means a device which provides an accurate representation of the
flight deck of a particular aircraft type to the extent that the mechanical, electrical,
electronic and the like, aircraft systems control functions, the normal environment of
flight crew members, and the performance and flight characteristics of that type of aircraft
are realistically simulated;
(21F) “Flight Simulation Training Device” means Flight Simulator, Flight Procedures
Trainers or Basic Instrument Flight Trainer in which flight conditions are simulated on the
ground;”;

(iv) for clause (33C), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(33C) “Maintenance” means the performance of tasks on an aircraft, engine, propeller or
associated part required to ensure the continuing airworthiness of an aircraft, engine,



[T I—ATT 3(i)] T T TSI - AHTLTIT 13

)

propeller or associated part including any one or combination of overhaul, inspection,
replacement, defect rectification, and the embodiment of a modification or repair;”;

for clauses (48AA) and 48(B), the following clauses shall be substituted, namely:—

“(48AA) “Safety” means the state in which the risks associated with aviation activities,
related to, or in direct support of the operation of aircraft, are reduced and controlled to an
acceptable level.

Explanation. — For the purposes of this clause, the expression “acceptable level” is the
minimum degree of safety that must be assured by a system in actual practice;

(48B) “Safety Data” means a defined set of facts or set of safety values collected from
various aviation related sources, which is used to maintain or improve safety;

(48C) “Safety Information” means safety data processed, organised or analysed in a given
context so as to make it useful for safety management purposes;

(48D) “Safety Oversight” means a function performed by a State to ensure that individuals
and organisations performing an aviation activity comply with safety related national laws
and regulations.;”

(B) rule 29(D) shall be re-numbered as rule 29D and after rule 29D as so re- numbered, the

following rules shall be inserted, namely:—

“29E. Mandatory safety reporting system.—The Directorate General of Civil Aviation shall
establish a mandatory safety reporting system to facilitate collection of safety data and safety
information on actual or potential safety deficiencies and specify the procedure for the same.

29F. Voluntary safety reporting system.— (1) The Directorate General of Civil Aviation
shall establish a voluntary safety reporting system to facilitate collection of safety data and
safety information on actual or potential safety deficiencies that may not be captured by the
mandatory safety reporting system established under rule 29E.

(2) The voluntary safety reporting system established under sub-rule (1) shall be non-punitive
and afford protection to safety data captured by, and safety information derived from, voluntary
safety reporting system and related sources and if considered expedient by the Central
Government, the safety data and safety information may be collected through any other agency.

(3) The safety data and safety information so collected under sub-rule (1) shall be handled in a
manner so as to prevent its use for purposes other than safety, and shall appropriately be safe
guarded and the confidentiality about the identity of the person making report shall be
maintained.”;

(C) inrule 30, after sub-rule (1A), the following rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1B) The Central Government may, on receipt of application along with the fee provided in
sub-rule (3B) of rule 35, reserve a registration mark for a period of one year, which may be
further extended for one year at a time.”;

(D) inrule 35, --

(1) after sub-rule (3A), the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:--

“(3B) A fee of rupees ten thousand shall be payable for reserving a registration mark and such
reservation may further be extended on payment of ten thousand rupees at a time.”

(i1) for sub-rule (4), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:—

“(4) The fee shall be paid electronically in the manner as specified by the Director-General.”;

(E) after rule 38B, the following rules shall be inserted, namely:—

“38C. Flight Dispatcher Approval. — (1) No operator shall assign duties to a person as a
flight dispatcher without prior approval of the Director-General.

(2) An operator may apply along with prescribed fee to the Director-General for obtaining
approval of flight dispatcher.



14

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(3) The Director General may specify the requirements for approval of Flight Dispatcher.

(4) The Director-General may, on being satisfied that a person has met all the requirements to
act as a flight dispatcher, grant an approval of flight dispatcher to operator.

(5) The approval granted under sub-rule (4), unless suspended or cancelled, shall remain valid
for a period not exceeding five years, and on being satisfied, the Director General may renew it
for a further period not exceeding five years at a time.

(6) Fee for approval as flight dispatcher shall be rupees five thousand only and fee for renewal

of flight dispatcher approval shall be rupees two thousand five hundred only.

(7) The fee shall be paid electronically in the manner as specified by the Director-General.”;
(F) in rule 39C, in sub-rule (1), in Table, —

(1) for serial number (ii) and the entries relating thereto, following serial numbers and entries

shall be substituted, namely :—

« ... |Commercial Pilot’s Licence (aeroplanes or helicopters) .
(i) and Flight Navigator’s Licence Twelve months  [Five years
up to the
validity of
(iia) [Flight Radio Telephone Operator’s Licence Twelve months  [Radio
Telephone
Restricted”;

(i1) in serial number (iii), in column (3), for words “Five years”, the words “” Ten years” shall be
substituted;

(G) inrule 41A, after sub-rule (3), the following sub-rules shall be inserted, namely : —

“(3A) The Director General may specify the requirements for approval of Check Pilots and
Examiners.

(3B) The approval granted under sub-rule (3), unless suspended or cancelled, shall remain valid for
a period not exceeding five years, and on being satisfied, the Director General may renew it for a
further period not exceeding five years at a time.

(3C) The Director General may also appoint examiners for standardisation check of Check Pilots
and Examiners approved under sub-rule (3) and specify the manner in which such checks shall be

carried

out.”;

(H) inrule 41B,—

(1) in the heading, for the word “Approved”, the word “Flying” shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-rule (4), in clause (¢), —

(a) for the words “period of two years”, the words “period not exceeding five

years” shall be substituted;

(b) the proviso shall be omitted;

(ii1) for sub-rule (5), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:—

“(5) The fee shall be paid electronically in the manner as specified by the Director-

General.”;

(I) after rule 41B, the following rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“41C. Flight Simulation Training Device Qualification Certificate. —

(1) An organisation may apply along with prescribed fee to the Director-General for a
Qualification Certificate of Flight Simulation Training Device or for the validation of a



[T I—ATT 3(i)] T T TSI - AHTLTIT 15

Qualification Certificate issued by the Civil Aviation Authority of a Contracting State in
respect of a Flight Simulation Training Device.

Explanation. — For the purpose of this sub-rule (1), the organisation means:
(a) an Operator;
(b) a Training Organisation approved under these rules; or

(c) a Training Organisation approved by civil aviation authority of a contracting state for
operating and maintaining Flight Simulation Training Device.

2) The Director-General may specify the requirements for Qualification Certificate or
validation of Flight Simulation Training Device and the type of trainings which can be imparted on
such devices.

3) The Director-General may on being satisfied that it met all the requirements, issue a
Qualification Certificate or validate the Qualification Certificate of Flight Simulation Training
Device issued elsewhere, as the case may be.

(4) No airline operator shall use such qualified or validated Flight Simulation Training Device for
the training of their personnel without obtaining written permission from the Director-General in
the form and manner as specified by him.

(5) If the Director—General is satisfied that there is sufficient ground for doing so, after giving
him an opportunity of being heard and reasons to be recorded in writing, may suspend or cancel
such certificate or validation, as the case may be.

(6) The Qualification Certificate or validation granted under sub-rule (3), unless suspended or
cancelled, shall remain valid for a period not exceeding two years, and on being satisfied, the
Director General may renew it for a further period not exceeding two years at a time.

(7) Fee for Qualification Certificate or validation of Flight Simulation Training Device for aircraft
type having maximum permissible take-off weight more than 5700 kilograms shall be rupees two
lakh only and for renewal of such certificate or validation, as the case may be, the fee shall be
rupees one lakh only.

(8) Fee for Qualification Certificate or validation of Flight Simulator Training Device for aircraft
type having maximum permissible take-off weight up to 5700 Kilograms shall be rupees one lakh
only and for renewal of such certificate or validation, as the case may be, the fee shall be rupees
fifty thousand only.

(9) An additional amount of two lakh fifty thousand rupees or cost of travel including per diem,
whichever is higher, shall be payable if the inspection, audit or surveillance in respect of issue or
renewal of validation of Qualification Certificate of a Flight Simulator Training Device is required
to be carried out at any place outside of India.

(10) The fee shall be paid electronically in the manner as specified by the Director-General.”;
(J) in rule 48, —

(1) in sub-rule (1), for serial number (ix) and entries relating thereto, the following serial
numbers and entries shall be substituted, namely:—

“(ix) [Where the examination is conducted online: Rs 2500 per paper

(x) [Where the examination is conducted online on demand : Rs. 5000 per paper™;

(ii) in sub-rule (2), for the opening portion, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“For all flying tests, the candidate or operator, as the case may be, shall be required to provide the
aircraft or flight simulator and bear all charges in this respect, and if a Government Examiner is
carried on board during the flying test or standardisation check, the following fee shall be payable
to the Central Government, namely: —;



16 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(iii) for sub-rule (2A),the following sub-rules shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2A) For Approval or Renewal of Check Pilots or Examiners, the following fee shall be payable,
namely: —

(1) Approval of Check Pilots or Examiners: Rs. 10,000/-

(i1) Renewal of Check Pilots or Examiners: Rs. 5,000/-

(2AA) The fee shall be paid electronically in the manner as specified by the Director-General.”;
(K) inrule 61, —

(1) for sub-rules (3), (4) and (4A), the following sub-rules shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) The Aircraft Maintenance Engineer’s licence may be granted in the following
categories and sub-categories, as applicable, namely: —

(a) Category A, classified into the following sub-categories: —
(1) A1 Aeroplanes Turbine;
(i) A2 Aeroplanes Piston;
(ii) A3 Helicopters Turbine;
(iv) A4 Helicopters Piston.
(b) Category B, classified into the following sub-categories:--
(1) B1.1 Aeroplanes Turbine;
(i) B1.2 Aeroplanes Piston;
(ii) B1.3 Helicopters Turbine;
(iv) B1.4 Helicopters Piston.
(c) Category B2, applicable to all aircraft.

(d) Category B2L, applicable to all aircraft shall be issued with the ‘system rating’ as
specified by the Director General.

(e) Category B3, applicable to piston-engine non-pressurised aeroplanes of 2000
kilogram Maximum Take-off Mass and below.

(f) Category L, classified into the following sub-categories: —
(1) L1C: Composite sailplanes;
(i1) L1: sailplanes;

(iii) L2C: composite powered sailplanes and composite Light Aircraft 1
aeroplanes;

(iv) L2: powered sailplanes and Light Aircraft 1 aeroplanes;
(v) L3H: hot-air balloons;

(vi) L3G: gas balloons;

(vii) L4H: hot-air airships;

(viii) L4G: Light Aircraft 2 gas airships; and

(ix) L5: gas airships other than Light Aircraft 2.

Note: Light Aircraft 1 and Light Aircraft 2 means a manned aircraft as specified
by the Director-General.

(g) Category C, applicable to aeroplanes and helicopters.”;



[T I—ATT 3(i)] T T TSI - AHTLTIT 17

(4) The holder of an aircraft maintenance licence shall have his licence endorsed with the
relevant rating for exercising the certification privileges as laid down in sub-rule (12) of
this rule:

(1) For Category B1, B2, B2L, C and L, the relevant aircraft or system ratings
shall be as specified by the Director-General.

(i1) For Category B3, the relevant rating shall be ‘piston-engine non-
pressurised aeroplanes of 2000 kilogram Maximum Take-off Mass and
below’.

(1i1) For Category A, no rating shall be endorsed.”;

(i) in sub-rule (5), in clause (d), for sub-clauses (i) and (ii), the following sub-clauses shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(1) for Category A, Sub-categories B1.2, B1.4 and Category B3:

(A) three years of practical aircraft maintenance experience on operating aircraft;
or

(B) two years of practical maintenance experience on operating aircraft, covering
the corresponding system rating, and having acquired a Degree in Aircraft
Maintenance or Degree in Engineering from a recognised University; or

(C) one year of practical maintenance experience on operating aircraft, covering
the corresponding system rating, and having successfully completed basic aircraft
maintenance training conducted by a training organisation approved under rule
133B.

(i) for Sub-categories B1.1 and B1.3 and Category B2:
(A) five years of practical aircraft maintenance experience on operating aircraft; or

(B) three years of practical maintenance experience on operating aircraft, covering
the corresponding system rating, and having acquired a Degree in Aircraft
Maintenance or Degree in Engineering from a recognised University; or

(C) two year of practical maintenance experience on operating aircraft, covering
the corresponding system rating, and having successfully completed basic aircraft
maintenance training conducted by a training organisation approved under rule
133B.

(iia) for Category B2L:

(A) three years of practical maintenance experience in operating aircraft, covering
the corresponding system rating, if the applicant has no previous relevant technical
training; or

(B) two years of practical maintenance experience on operating aircraft, covering
the corresponding system rating, and having acquired a Degree in Aircraft
Maintenance or Degree in Engineering from a recognised University; or

(C) one year of practical maintenance experience on operating aircraft, covering
the corresponding system rating, and having successfully completed basic aircraft
maintenance training conducted by a training organisation approved under rule
133B.

(iib) for Category L:
(A) two years of practical experience in operating aircraft covering a
representative cross section of maintenance activities in the corresponding sub-
category; or
(B) one years of practical maintenance experience on operating aircraft, covering
the corresponding system rating, and having acquired a Degree in Aircraft
Maintenance or Degree in Engineering from a recognized University or



18

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(iid)

(iv)

successfully completed basic aircraft maintenance training conducted by a training
organisation approved under rule 133B:

Provided that for the addition of a category or a sub-category or addition
within a category or a sub-category or a system rating to an existing licence, the
practical maintenance experience relevant to the category, sub-category or new
system rating shall be as specified by the Director General:

Provided also that twelve years of practical aircraft maintenance experience
acquired outside a civil aircraft maintenance environment in the relevant category
supplemented by at least one year of recent experience in civil aircraft maintenance
environment, shall be treated as equivalent to the requirements laid down in (i) to

(iib) above.”;

in sub-rule (11), in clause (a), for words “five years”, occurring at both the places, the

words “ten years” shall be substituted.;

in sub-rule (12), —

(a) in clause (ii), in Explanation (b), for word, letter and figure “Category B3”, the words,
letters and figure “Category B3 or Category L” shall be substituted;

(b) after clause (ii1), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(iiia) Category B2L licence holder to issue certificates of release to service and to act as
B2L support staff for the maintenance performed on electrical systems; maintenance
performed on avionics systems within the limits of the system ratings specifically endorsed
on the licence; and when holding the ‘airframe system’ rating, performance of electrical
and avionics tasks within power plant and mechanical systems, requiring only simple tests

to prove their serviceability.”;

(c) after clause (iv), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(iva) Category L licence holder to issue certificates of release to service and to act as L
support staff for maintenance performed on aircraft structure, power plant and mechanical
and electrical systems; work on radio, Emergency Locator Transmitters and transponder
systems; and work on other avionics systems requiring simple tests to prove their

serviceability.”;

(v) for sub-rule (14), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:—

“(14) A person holding a valid Aircraft Maintenance Engineers Licence in the old format
may be issued, with or without limitation and without further examination, an Aircraft
Maintenance Engineers Licence in the appropriate category under this rule subject to such
conditions as may be specified by the Director-General.”;

(L) in rule 62, —

(1) in sub-rule (1), in the Table, under item (E), for serial number (i) and entries relating thereto, the
following serial number and entries shall be substituted, namely:—

M

(a) for normal examination
(b) for online examination

(c) online on demand examination

Rs. 500 per paper
Rs 1500 per paper
Rs. 3,000 per paper™;

(ii) for sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2) The fee shall be paid electronically in the manner as specified by the Director-General.”;

(M) in rule 84, for the words “twenty-four months”, occurring at both the places, the words “five years”
shall be substituted;

(N) in rule 87, for sub-rule (3), the following rule shall be substituted, namely:—



[T I—ATT 3(i)] T T TSI - AHTLTIT 19

“(3) The fee shall be paid electronically in the manner as specified by the Director-General.”;
(O) inrule 133B, —
(1) in sub-rule (1),—
(a) in clause (a), in sub-clause (ii), for the words “and continuing airworthiness

management of an aircraft”, the words “including aircraft components” shall be
substituted;

(b) in clause (b), —

(1) for the words “Continuing Airworthiness Management Exposition”, the words
“Combined Airworthiness Exposition” shall be substituted;

(i1) for the words “Training Manual”, the words “Training Manual and Maintenance
Training Organisation Exposition” shall be substituted;

(i1) after sub-rule (3A), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that an approval granted under sub-rule (3) for the maintenance of aircraft
engaged in scheduled air transport service other than scheduled commuter air transport service,
unless suspended or cancelled, shall remain valid for a period not exceeding ten years on
complying the requirements as specified by the Director General and on being satisfied, the
Director General may renew the approval for a further period of ten years.”;

(P) in rule 133C, —

(1) in sub-rule (1), the words “for any inspection, examination or test to be conducted” shall be
omitted;

(i) in sub-rule (2A), for the words “inspection, examination or test mentioned in sub-rule (1), the
words “inspection, audit or surveillance for the grant or renewal or extension of approval” shall be
substituted;

(iil)  in sub-rule (2B), —

(a) for the word “inspection”, the words “the inspection” shall be substituted;
(b) for the word “approval”, the words “approval or renewal of acceptance” shall be
substituted;

(iv) in sub-rule (4), for the word “paid”, the words “paid electronically” shall be substituted;
(Q) in rule 134A, in sub-rule (5), —
(1) in clause (c) after the words” giving wrong Information,” the word “ or” shall be inserted.
(ii) after clause ( ¢ ) as so amended , the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(d) the security clearance of the holder of Non-Scheduled Operator’s Permit has been
withdrawn or denied by the Central Government,”;

(R) in rule 154,—

(1) in clause (a), for the words “inspection and certification”, the words “inspection, certification
and continuing airworthiness management of an aircraft” shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (b), for the words “’Operators' Maintenance System Manual' or 'Operators' Quality
Control Manual™, the words “‘Operators’ Continuing Airworthiness Management Exposition’ or
‘Quality Manual”” shall be substituted;

(S) in rule 155A, —

(1) after sub-rule (2), the following sub-rules shall be inserted, namely:—



20

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

“(2A) The approval granted under sub-rule (2), unless suspended or cancelled, shall remain
valid for a period not exceeding ten years in case of a person holding an air operator
certificate issued under rule 134 and engaged in scheduled air transport service and on
being satisfied, the Director General may renew the approval for a further period of ten
years.

(2B) The approval granted under sub-rule (2), unless suspended or cancelled, shall remain
valid for a period not exceeding five years in case of a person holding an air operator
certificate issued under rule 134 and engaged in scheduled commuter air transport service
or a Non-scheduled Operator’s Permit issued under rule 134A and on being satistied, the
Director General may renew the approval for a further period of five years.

(2C) The approval granted under sub-rule (2), unless suspended or cancelled, shall remain
valid for a period not exceeding two years in case of a person holding an authorisation
issued under rule 134B and on being satisfied, the Director General may renew the
approval for a further period of two years.”;

(i) in sub-rule (3), in clause (b), for the words “Civil Aviation Department”, the words
“Directorate General of Civil Aviation” shall be substituted;

(T) after rule 155A, the following rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“155B. Fee.- (1) The following fee shall be payable for grant of approval under rule 155A, in
respect of an operator other than a private owner:

(1) person holding an air operator certificate to operate scheduled air transport service issued under
rule 134 or involved in continuing airworthiness management of an aircraft of a person holding an
air operator certificate to operate scheduled air transport service issued under rule 134:  Rupees 8
lakh

(i1) person holding an air operator certificate to operate scheduled commuter air transport service
issued under rule 134 or involved in continuing airworthiness management of an aircraft of a
person holding an air operator certificate to operate scheduled commuter air transport service
issued under rule 134: Rupees 4 lakh

(iii) person holding a Non-scheduled Operator’s Permit issued under rule 134A or involved in
continuing airworthiness management of an aircraft of a person holding a Non-scheduled
Operator’s Permit issued under rule 134A: Rupees 2 lakh

(iv) person holding an authorisation issued under rule 134B or involved in continuing airworthiness
management of an aircraft of a person holding an authorisation issued under rule 134B: Rupees 2
lakh

(2) The fee for renewal or extension of scope of approval under rule 155A shall be fifty percent of
the fee payable under sub-rule (1).

(3) The fee shall be paid electronically in the manner as specified by the Director-General.”;

(U) in Schedule II, —

(1) under the heading Section A, after paragraph 8A, the following paragraph shall be inserted,
namely:—

“9. Renewal. — Licence and rating may be renewed on receipt of satisfactory evidence of the
applicant having complied with requirements as laid down under rule 42 and respective section of
schedule I1.”;

(i1) under the heading Section K, —

(a) in paragraph 1 under the sub-heading “Requirements for issue of licence”, —

(1) in clause (e), in sub-clause (iv), for the words “which not less than”, the words “which not
more than” shall be substituted;



[T I—ATT 3(i)] T T TSI - AHTLTIT 21

(i1) in clause (h), the following proviso shall be inserted , namely :—

“Provided that the Director-General may, however, allow Skill Test or part thereof to be carried
out on an approved Flight Simulator for the type of helicopter.”;

(b) in paragraph 6 under the sub-heading “Privileges”, in first proviso, for the words “five take-offs
and five landing patterns and one route check to the satisfaction of an Examiner”, the words “ten
take-offs and ten landing patterns” shall be substituted;

(ii1) under the heading Section N, —

(a) in paragraph 1, under the sub-heading “Requirements for issue of licence”, at the end of clause
(g), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided that the Director-General may, however, allow Skill Test or part thereof to be carried out
on an approved Flight Simulator for the type of helicopter.”;

(b) in paragraph 3, under the sub-heading “Renewal”, in clause (d), for the word “licence”, the
words “licence or on an approved Flight Simulator allowed by the Director- General,” shall be
substituted;

(¢) in paragraph 6, under the sub-heading “Privileges”, —

(1) in first proviso, for the words “a Check Pilot”, the words “an Examiner or Instructor or
Check Pilot” shall be substituted;

(i) after the first proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided further that in case of a pilot having previous experience of at least 100 hours as
Pilot-in-Command of helicopters having all-up weight exceeding 5700 kilograms, the required
number of route checks may be reduced to six out of which at least three shall be by night:”

(iv) under the heading Section P, —

(a) in paragraph 2, under the sub-heading “Validity”, in clause (b), for the words “instrument rating
flying test”, the words “Instrument Rating Renewal Check™ shall be substituted;

(b) in paragraph 3 under the sub-heading “Renewal”, for clause (a), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(a) having satisfactorily completed the Instrument Rating Renewal Check on the helicopter with an
Examiner or Instructor or on an approved Flight Simulator allowed by the Director-General.

(v) under the heading Section Y, paragraph 3 shall be omitted;
(V) in Schedule VIB, in paragraph 2, in Table 2, —

(1) after serial number 39, the following serial number and entries shall be inserted, namely :—

“39A. Contravention of sub-rule (1) of | Sub-rule (1) of rule 38C | Level 37;
rule 38C

(ii) after serial number 41, the following serial number and entries shall be inserted, namely :—

“41A. Contravention of sub-rule (4) of | Sub-rule (4) ofrule 41C | Level 5”.
rule 41 C

[F.No. AV-11012/1/2021-DG]
SATYENDRA KUMAR MISHRA, Jt. Secy.



22 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

Note: The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, vide notification number V-26, dated the
23 March, 1937 and last amended vide G.S.R. 327(E), dated the 13® May, 2021 published in the
Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), dated the 13" May, 2021.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. a3 =2



